John Rendon

From: John Rendon

Sent: Friday, March 5, 2021 10:58 AM

To: pomalleylaw@aol.com

Cc: Michelle Morris

Subject: RE: Payment

Attachments: FW: Registration; FW: Herring River; Boat Registration - Herring River Mooring #409
Mr. O’'Malley,

Since Sep 2017 you have been notified on several occasions by this office of the need to have the Grady White
registered in your name as the mooring permit holder, as evident from the attached emails. | understand that it has
become more difficult now that the office is closed due to the pandemic, but you’'ve had several years now to correct
the issue. | will have Michelle process your mooring permit payment, however, if you do not meet the 30 day mooring
use requirement in the upcoming boating season with a boat that is registered in your name as the permit holder, then
your mooring permit will be revoked at the end of the season, which is Columbus Day weekend. It will be your
responsibility to provide this office with a current boat registration that is in your name. Stated regulations are outlined
in the Harbor Management Plan, which you can view on the town website. Thank you. regards,

John C. Rendon
Harbormaster
Town of Harwich
774 212-6193 (c)

From: Michelle Morris

Sent: Friday, March 5, 2021 9:56 AM

To: John Rendon <jrendon@town.harwich.ma.us>
Subject: FW: Payment

Pichelle P2 Porris

Saquatucket Municipal Marina
715 Main Street - P.O. Box 207
Harwich Port, MA 02646

Phone: (508)430-7532/Fax: (508)430-7535

From: pomalleylaw®@aol.com [mailto:pomalleylaw@aol.com]
Sent: Friday, March 5, 2021 9:51 AM

To: Michelle Morris <mmorris@town.harwich.ma.us>
Subject: Re: Payment

Hi Michelle

| have tried calling the office of environmental police to find out what | need to change. Per the voice mail the office is
closed because of the pandemic. They refer you to the website which | have tried before but to no avail. | will send
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another email to see if | can speak to someone. | would expect that | will not make the dates you referred to in your
email. Can't you extend the dates based on the fact the office of Environmental Affairs is closed?

Patrick

-----Original Message-----

From: Michelle Morris <mmorris@town.harwich.ma.us>
To: PATRICK O MALLEY <pomalleylaw@aol.com>
Cc: John Rendon <jrendon@town.harwich.ma.us>
Sent: Fri, Mar 5, 2021 8:57 am

Subject: Payment

| received your payment for your mooring. As discussed | cannot renew without proof that the vessel is registered to you.
| will put the payment through Accounting to refund the $190.00. The deadline for mooring payments is March 15, | will
need documentation and payment by this date. If you cannot make the deadline, there is a $50.00 late fee that will extend
your due date to April 1.

Thanks,

Michelle N. Morris

Saquatucket Municipal Marina
715 Main Street - P.O. Box 207
Harwich Port, MA 02646

Phone: (508)430-7532/Fax: (508)430-7535



